
throughout fiscal year 2010, both the state’s
financial condition and cash flow position
continued to deteriorate rapidly, as spending
pressures were left largely unabated and as
the recession continued to impact state rev-
enues.  illinois ended the year in the worst fis-
cal position in its history.  at the end of June,
the backlog of unpaid bills and fund transfers
in the illinois office of the Comptroller (ioC)
stood at $4.712 billion. this compares to last
year’s end of year payables of $2.785 billion.
Just as important, the delay in paying vouch-
ers was 153 working days this June compared
to 99 days at this time last year.  some trans-
fers to other state funds have been delayed for
the entire fiscal year and the state was unable
to transfer $276 million back to the Budget
stabilization Fund on June 30th.  Both the
amount payable and the days delayed are
record highs.

the chart of adjusted General revenue Fund
(GrF) balances shows the balance on June
30, 2010 to be a negative $4.692 billion.  this
is the lowest end of year balance on the chart
and will be the lowest budgetary balance in
history after accounting for spending in the
state’s lapse period.  a few factors have had a
major impact on the cash flow position – the
state’s economy-driven revenues weakened
and spending was transferred to other funds
in the fourth quarter.

although the backlog of bills is historically
high, this is a modest improvement from
what was anticipated at the end of the third
quarter.  this is due primarily to the transfer
of approximately $1.8 billion in medicaid
spending from GrF to the Healthcare
provider relief Fund and tobacco settlement
recovery Fund, a reallocation of over $300

million in state Board of education quarterly
grant payments from the GrF to the
education assistance Fund, and marginally
better revenue collections in the fourth quar-
ter than originally projected.  However, near-
ly $2.6 billion in fiscal year 2010 General
Funds appropriations remain unexpended and
a large portion of that may be submitted for
payment in the next two months for remain-
ing fiscal year 2010 obligations. 

Base spending for the year was down 8.8%
due to the backlog of payables, the decline in
pension payments due to the borrowing this
year for these payments, and the transfer of
medicaid spending to other funds.

While base revenues decreased 4.2% in fiscal
year 2010, it is the decline in economic rev-

enue sources that greatly impacted the ioC’s
ability to pay the state’s bills. Corporate
income tax receipts were down 20.5%, sales
tax receipts have decreased $465 million or
6.9%, and individual income tax receipts fell
$712 million or 7.7%.  these declines were
partially offset by transfers into the General
Funds. With the failure in economy-driven
revenues, the Governor has proposed a $1.3
billion “revenue failure” short-term borrow-
ing for late July.

base revenues

at the end of fiscal year 2010, base revenues
decreased $1.211 billion or 4.2% for a total of
$27.933 billion. state sources of revenue were
down $564 million or 2.5% while federal
sources decreased $647 million (9.9%) to
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$5.920 billion which includes $1.607 billion
from the federal stimulus program.  at the end
of year, income taxes had decreased $1.062
billion with individual income taxes down
$712 million (7.7%) while corporate income
taxes declined $350 million (20.5%).  With
the recession impacting consumers, sales tax
receipts decreased $465 million or 6.9%.  

Cash receipts from other sources decreased
$123 million or 3.8% due primarily to the
expected declines in investment income
(down $55 million or 67.9%), inheritance tax
receipts (down $45 million or 15.6%), Cook
County iGt (down $9 million), and insur-
ance taxes (down $12 million).  public utility
taxes declined $79 million due to decreases of
$44 million in telecommunications tax
receipts, $13 million in gas tax receipts, and
$22 million in electric tax receipts.

For fiscal year 2010, transfers in increased by
$1.086 billion.  state Gaming Fund transfers
are down $47 million while lottery Fund
transfers were unchanged.  all other transfers
increased primarily due to the $835 million
transferred from the pension Contribution
Fund in January for a repayment of pension
payments made during the first half of the fis-
cal year.  also legislated transfers of $283
million from fund sweeps and $110 million
from the Capital projects Fund (to cover a
portion of the cost of moving two state agen-
cies to GrF from the road Fund) contributed
to the increase in transfers in. 

Federal sources of revenue decreased $647
million or 9.9%, primarily due to the alloca-
tion of medicaid spending (and its resulting
federal reimbursements) in the last quarter to
the Healthcare provider relief Fund.  the
federal stimulus plan generated $1.607 billion
in fiscal year 2010, an increase of $41 million
from last year.  

base expenditures

in prior years’ quarterly reports, comparative
analysis has been utilized between categories
of spending such as awards and grants and
operations. major agencies or groups of
agencies’ spending were compared by cate-
gory.  However, due to the manner in which
this year’s budget was appropriated, that level
of detail is incomparable to previous fiscal
years and this report instead will present com-
parisons by individual agencies.    

through June, base General Funds spending
declined by $2.648 billion or 8.8% when
compared to the previous year.  For the last
quarter of the fiscal year, base spending
declined by $3.178 billion. total agency
vouchers presented for payment were down
$3.634 billion and the adjustment in vouchers
payable was up $1.440 billion while regular
transfers out were down $451 million.

only the Departments of aging (up $84 mil-
lion or 15.4%) and state police (up $54 mil-
lion or 25.1%) showed increases in vouchers
presented among major agencies.  the
increase to the state police is due to a funding
shift away from the road Fund to GrF.  

remaining General Funds appropriations
along with budgeted decreased appropria-
tions to the Department of Healthcare and
Family services (DHFs) explain a good por-
tion of the decline in both total agency and
DHFs spending. in addition to an initial $712
million or 8.5% decrease in appropriations in
fiscal year 2010, $1.562 billion remains
unspent by DHFs heading into the lapse peri-
od.  For cash flow purposes, a conscious
effort was made to steer away medicaid
spending from GrF in the fourth quarter of
the fiscal year and utilize the tobacco
settlement and Health Care provider relief
funds.  through June, DHFs’ General Funds
spending is down $2.395 billion or 26.2%
from last year and accounts for 65.9% of the
total decrease in vouchers presented for all
agencies. in the fourth quarter alone,
Healthcare and Family services spending
was down $2.201 billion.  

other major agencies which had a large drop
in vouchers presented for payment include the
teachers retirement system (down $648 mil-
lion or 40.4% due to the sale of state general
obligation pension bonds), Higher education
(down $182 million or 7.6%), the Department
of Human services (down $128 million or
3.1%), Corrections (down $127 million or
9.9%), state Board of education (down $112
million or 1.5%) and Children and Family
services (down $53 million or 5.9%).

What lies ahead

Following the close of a fiscal year, tradition-
ally the state has until august 31st, the “lapse
period,” during which it can pay the bills
from the prior fiscal year’s appropriations.
these bills may be the unpaid bills on June

30th or any other bills forwarded to the ioC
in July and august to pay for expenses
incurred prior to the end of the year.
However, the amount of money required to
pay for fiscal year 2010’s obligations will be
at an unprecedented level – perhaps
approaching $6 billion depending on state
agency submissions – and illinois would be
unable to pay all of these obligations by the
end of august in almost any scenario.  in light
of this, public act 96-958 extends the state’s
lapse period through the end of December
2010.  all vouchers must be filed with ioC
by the end of august, but the state will now
have until the end of December 2010 to pay
down these liabilities.  

several revenue events will have to occur in
the coming months for fiscal year 2010 lapse
period spending to be completed by
December 31st. these include the $1.3 billion
revenue failure borrowing proposed by the
Governor, newly authorized borrowing by the
GrF from other funds in the state’s treasury,
and securitization of the state’s tobacco settle-
ment payments that is expected to garner $1.2
billion. the precise timing of these events is
uncertain, but they are essential for the state to
meet its fiscal year 2010 obligations.  

However, even with the extension of the
state’s lapse period and these revenue events,
it will be extremely challenging to close out
fiscal year 2010 and maintain key functions
of state government.  other than payments for
mandated debt service on state bonds, gener-
al state aid to education, federal stimulus
related medicaid and critical state operations,
an extremely limited amount of fiscal year
2011’s obligations are likely to be addressed
in calendar year 2010 while the state is still
dealing with the prior fiscal year’s bills.

as a large portion of the fiscal year 2011 rev-
enues must be set aside to pay the prior year’s
bills, payment delays over the course of the
next year are likely to be even more prolonged
than what was seen in fiscal year 2010.  even
with a reasonable economic revenue perform-
ance and the revenue events mentioned above,
absent any significant changes to the current
budget plan either through reserves, appropri-
ation reductions, pension bonding or major
revenue enhancements, the state will likely
end fiscal year 2011 with a GrF bill backlog
significantly higher than that at the end of fis-
cal year 2010. n
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